
CITY OF CLEARWATER

ITB # 11-22, Natural Gas Regulators NOTE:  Highlighted Cell indicates items that were not bid on.

DUE DATE: December 15, 2021; 10:00 AM

BID REVIEW

Item No. Description 
Est. Quantity

(UOM)

Unit Price

(UOM)
 Total Price 

Unit Price

(UOM)
 Total Price 

Unit Price

(UOM)
 Total Price 

1  HSR 3/4" ANGLE BODY - Inlet Pressure: 60 PSIG 1,500 $63.36  $             95,040.00 $43.55  $             65,325.00 $43.63  $             65,445.00 

2 HSR 3/4" ANGLE BODY - Inlet Pressure: 6 PSIG 500 $63.36  $             31,680.00 $43.55  $             21,775.00 $43.63  $             21,815.00 

3 HSR 3/4" GLOBE BODY - Inlet Pressure: 60 PSIG 200 $63.36  $             12,672.00 $43.55  $               8,710.00 $40.06  $               8,012.00 

4 HSR 3/4" GLOBE BODY - Inlet Pressure: 6 PSIG 200 $63.36  $             12,672.00 $43.55  $               8,710.00 $40.06  $               8,012.00 

5 HSR 1" GLOBE BODY - Inlet Pressure: 60 PSIG 300 $63.36  $             19,008.00 $43.55  $             13,065.00 $47.90  $             14,370.00 

6 HSR 1" GLOBE BODY - Inlet Pressure: 6 PSIG 300 $63.36  $             19,008.00 $43.55  $             13,065.00 $47.90  $             14,370.00 

7

DIRECT OPERATED PRESSURE REDUCING 

REGULATOR (Equivalent to Fisher 627) 15 $288.98  $               4,334.70 $266.00  $               3,990.00 $173.59  $               2,603.85 

8

CONSTANT PRESSURE PILOT LOADED 

REGULATOR LT GREEN MAIN SPRING, BLUE PILOT 

SRING (Equivalent to Itron CL231) 25 $816.81  $             20,420.25 $878.00  $             21,950.00 $634.20  $             15,855.00 

9

 2" FLANGED  SPRING LOADED, SELF REGULATED 

GAS REGULATOR WITH INTERNAL RELIEF VALVE 

(Equivalent to Itron B34) 30 $593.56  $             17,806.80 $746.00  $             22,380.00 $334.23  $             10,026.90 

10

  2" FEMALE PIPE THREAD SPRING LOADED, SELF 

OPERATED GAS REGULATOR WITH INTERNAL 

RELIEF VALVE (Equivalent to Itron B34) 30 $454.61  $             13,638.30 $563.00  $             16,890.00 $259.43  $               7,782.90 

11

 1 1/4" SPRING LOADED, SELF OPERATED GAS 

REGULATOR WITH INTERNAL RELIEF (Equivalent to 

Itron B34SR) 10 $454.61  $               4,546.10 $230.00  $               2,300.00 $250.43  $               2,504.30 

12

SPRING LOADED THROTTLING RELIEF BACK 

PRESSURE REGULATOR (OVERPRESSURE RELIEF 

REGULATOR)(Equivalent to Fisher 289) 25 $169.40  $               4,235.00 $185.00  $               4,625.00 NO BID  $                          -   

13

SPRING LOADED THROTTLING RELIEF BACK 

PRESSURE REGULATOR (OVERPRESSURE RELIEF 

REGULATOR)(Equivalent to Fisher 289) 25 $169.40  $               4,235.00 $185.00  $               4,625.00 NO BID  $                          -   

14

PILOT OPERATED PRESSURE REDUCING 

REGULATOR (Equivalent to Fisher 299) 5 $1,233.54  $               6,167.70 $2,157.00  $             10,785.00 NO BID  $                          -   

15

PRESSURE REDUCING REGULATOR FOR 

REGULATOR STATIONS AND DISTRIC GATE 

STATIONS (Equivalent to Fisher 99) 5 $2,189.00  $             10,945.00 $3,128.00  $             15,640.00 NO BID  $                          -   

Total Bid Items 1 – 15:  $            276,408.85 Total Bid Items 1 – 15:  $            233,835.00 Total Bid Items 1 – 15:  $            170,796.95 

Control Southern Inc.

3850 Lakefield Drive

Suwanee, GA 30024

DevTech Sales, Inc.

118 South Lake Avenue

Avon Park, FL 33825

Equipment Controls Company

PO Box 728

Norcross, GA 30091
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