
CITY OF CLEARWATER

ITB # 10-21; Liquid Propane Gas Tanks

DUE DATE: December 29, 2020; 10:00 AM

BID TABULATION

Item
Estimated 

Annual Qty (A)

Price per Item for Week 

Ending 12/18/2020 (B)
Line Total (A*B)  Minimum Order Qty 

Manufacturer 

Being Supplied

Price per Item for Week 

Ending 12/18/2020 (B)
Line Total (A*B)  Minimum Order Qty 

Manufacturer Being 

Supplied

120- gallon ASME tanks 60 $792.86 $47,571.60 1 Quality Steel $710.00 $42,600.00 16 Quality Steel

250-gallon ASME tanks 54 $1,016.67 $54,900.18 1 Quality Steel $910.00 $49,140.00 9 Quality Steel

500-gallon ASME tanks 36 $1,692.86 $60,942.96 1 Quality Steel $1,515.00 $54,540.00 8 Quality Steel

1,000-gallon ASME tanks 5 $2,867.86 $14,339.30 1 Quality Steel $2,570.00 $12,850.00 5 Quality Steel

200-lbs DOT tanks 9 $385.72 $3,471.48 1 Manchester Tank $435.00 $3,915.00 16 Worthington Industries

420-lbs DOT tanks 81 $529.76 $42,910.56 1 Manchester Tank $540.00 $43,740.00 18 Worthington Industries

Grand Total: $224,136.08 Grand Total: $206,785.00

Item
Estimated 

Annual Qty (A)

Price per Item for Week 

Ending 12/18/2020 (B)
Line Total (A*B)  Minimum Order Qty 

Manufacturer 

Being Supplied

120- gallon ASME tanks 60 NO BID #VALUE!

250-gallon ASME tanks 54 NO BID #VALUE!

500-gallon ASME tanks 36 NO BID #VALUE!

1,000-gallon ASME tanks 5 NO BID #VALUE!

200-lbs DOT tanks 9 $393.59 $3,542.31 1 Manchester Tank

420-lbs DOT tanks 81 $540.00 $43,740.00 1 Manchester Tank

Grand Total: #VALUE!

REMARKS:  Price(s) with star (          ) indicates apparent low bidder, intent to award.

Quality Steel Corporation

Michel, LLC

dba R.E. Michel Company, LLC

Tempaco, Inc.


